Kenai Peninsula Borough Purchasing & Contracting

MEMORANDUM

TO: Peter A. Micciche, Borough Mayor

THRU: John Hedges, Purchasing & Contracting Director ${\mathcal H}$

FROM: Patti Hartley, Purchasing Assistant

DATE: June 10, 2025

RE: Authorization to Award a Contract for ITB25-052 Bulk Fuel Supply

The Purchasing and Contracting Office formally solicited and received bids for the ITB25-052 Bulk Fuel Supply. Bid packets were released on April 30, 2025 and the Invitation to Bid was advertised on Bid Express from April 30, 2025 – May 28, 2025.

The project consists of purchasing, supplying and delivering Heating Oil, Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel and Unleaded Gasoline to specific locations throughout the Kenai Peninsula Borough.

On the due date of May 28, 2025, three (3) bids were received and reviewed to ensure that all the specifications and delivery schedules were met. Below are the low bids for each region and fuel type.

Lot	<u>Location</u>	<u>Fuel Type</u>	<u>Bidder</u>
1	Soldotna	Heating	Petro 49 Inc. dba Petro Marine & Alaska Oil Sales
1	Soldotna	ULSD	Petro 49 Inc. dba Petro Marine & Alaska Oil Sales
1	Soldotna	Unleaded	Petro 49 Inc. dba Petro Marine & Alaska Oil Sales
2	Homer	Heating	Petro 49 Inc. dba Petro Marine & Alaska Oil Sales
2	Homer	ULSD	Petro 49 Inc. dba Petro Marine & Alaska Oil Sales
2	Homer	Unleaded	Petro 49 Inc. dba Petro Marine & Alaska Oil Sales
3	Kenai/Nikiski	Heating Oil	Petro 49 Inc. dba Petro Marine & Alaska Oil Sales
4	Seward/Bear Creek	Heating	Shoreside Petroleum Inc.

Your approval for this bid award is hereby requested. Funding for this project is available in the following accounts: 211.51610.42230 / 43610 (CES); 241.41010.42230 / 43610 (Maintenance); 290.32010.42230 / 43610 / 290.32122.42230 / 43610 (Solid Waste); 206.51110.42230 / 43610 (Nikiski Fire); 207.51210.42230 / 43610 (Bear Creek Fire); 212.51810.42230 / 43610 (Kachemak Emergency Services); 236.33950.42230 / 43610 (Roads); 209.51410.42230 / 43610 (Anchor Point); 100.11250.42230 / 43610 (OEM).

Alyun	6/12/2025
Peter A Micciche Borough Mayor	Date

FINANCE DEPARTMENT FUNDS VERIFIED

Acct. No. 211.51610.42230 \$35,000 / 43610 \$2,500 (CES)

241.41010.42230 \$30,000 / 43610 \$10,000 (Maintenance)

290.32010.42230 \$ 2,000 / 43610 \$ 2,500 (Solid Waste)

290.32122.42230 \$8,000 / 43610 \$10,000 (Solid Waste)

206.51110.42230 \$10,000 / 43610 \$50.000 (Nikiski Fire)

207.51210.42230 \$ 3,000 / 43610 \$25,000 (Bear Creek Fire)

212.51810.42230 \$5,000 / 43610 \$20,000 (KESA)

236.33950.42230 \$15 000 (Roads)

209.51410.42230 \$3,000 / 43610 \$10 000 (WES)

100.11250.42230 \$2,000 / 43610 \$5,000 (OEM)

NOTES: FY26 Contingent Upon Assembly Appropriation. Contract starts 7/1/25.

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID TAB FOR: ITB25-052 BULK FUEL SUPPLY - Soldotna

CONTRACTOR	LOCATION		BASE BID
		Heating	\$6,599.60
		USLD	\$97,329.60
Petro 49, Inc., dba Petro Marine		Unleaded	\$80,176.20
Services and Alaska Oil Sales	Anchorage, AK	Total	\$184,105.40
		Heating	\$8,160.00
		USLD	\$118,800.00
	Transport	Unleaded	\$95,760.00
Crowley Fuels	Anchorage, AK	Total	\$222,720.00
Shoreside Petroleum, Inc.	Anchorage, AK		NO BID

DUE DATE: May 28, 2025

KPB OFFICIAL:

John Hedges, Purchasing & Contracting Director

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID TAB FOR: ITB25-052 BULK FUEL SUPPLY - Kenai / Nikiski

CONTRACTOR	LOCATION		BASE BID
Petro 49, Inc., dba Petro Marine Services and Alaska Oil Sales	Anchorage, AK	Heating	\$4,949.70
Crowley Fuels	Anchorage, AK	Heating	\$6,120.00
Shoreside Petroleum, Inc.	Anchorage, AK	Heating	NO BID

DUE DATE: May 28, 2025

KPB OFFICIAL:

John Hedges, Purchasing & Contracting Director

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID TAB FOR: ITB25-052 BULK FUEL SUPPLY - Homer

CONTRACTOR	LOCATION		BASE BID
		Heating	\$10,284.45
		USLD	\$3,984.80
		Unleaded	\$9,944.55
Petro 49, Inc., dba Petro Marine Services and Alaska Oil Sales	Anchorage, AK	TOTAL	\$24,213.80
Crowley Fuels	Anchorage, AK		No Bid
Shoreside Petroleum, Inc.	Anchorage, AK		No Bid

DUE DATE: May 28, 2025

KPB OFFICIAL:

John Hedges, Purchasing & Contracting Director

KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID TAB FOR: ITB25-052 BULK FUEL SUPPLY - Seward Bear Creek

CONTRACTOR	LOCATION		BASE BID
Shoreside Petroleum, Inc.	Anchorage, AK	Heating	\$4,175.00
Petro 49, Inc., dba Petro Marine Services and Alaska Oil Sales	Anchorage, AK	Heating	No Bid
Crowley Fuels	Anchorage, AK	Heating	No Bid

DUE DATE: May 28, 2025

KPB OFFICIAL:

John Hedges, Parchasing & Contracting Director